Bid Tabulation
ITB 134-19

PARTS WASHING EQUIPMENT W/ MAINTENANCE

Ericka Andrew, Buyer -Ph:205-325-8707/E: andrewe@jccal.org

1 2
RENTAL & MAINTENANCE PARTS WASHING STATIONS [QTY] UoM SAFETY-KLEEN NCH CORPORATION D/B/A CERTIFIED LABORATORIES
MONTHLY [ MAINTENANCE MAINTENANCE
DRUM/STATION RENTAL | PRICINGOF | o =XTS0NCD DRUM/STATION BUYOUT | PRICINGOF | . EXTENDED
DESCRIPTIONS: PRICING RENTAL PRICING RENTAL
Safety-Kleen Sink-On-A-Drum Parts
1 Sink-On-A-Drum - Similar to a (30-gallon) 17 | EA ﬁf:&'?:ﬁgﬁ: jr?di(f)agfellﬁzlzap;:z PUREWASH MODEL NO. S530
size 87x33.25"x22.25" $45.00 | INCLUDED $9,180.00 $610.00 NO BID $10,370.00
Safety-Kleen Benchtop Parts Washer,
. - portable and adjustable Model 14. 5- PUREWASH MODEL NO.
2 Portable Brake Station - Similar to (5-gallon 2 EA gallon capacity.Sink Size KT1007
6.5"x20.5"x12.5" $35.00 | INCLUDED $840.00 $500.00 NOBID $500.00
Safety-Kleen Benchtop Low-Profile
. - Parts Washer Washer, Roll-around. 12
3 Portable Brake Station - Similar (15-gallon) 1 EA gallon. Model 24 Sink Size PUREWASH MODEL NO. B315
4.5""x32""x22"
X $48.00 | INCLUDED $576.00 $300.00 NO BID $300.00
GRAND TOTAL:| $128.00 |  $70.5°%6.00 GRAND TOTAL:| $1,410.00 ,

HOURLY RATES FOR ADDITIONAL SERVICING

***NO RENTAL & SERVICE AGREEMENT ***- BUYOUT ONLY OFFER

4 NON-EMERGENCY SERVICE (CALL-OUTS) OFFICE HOURS (7AM-3:30 P.M. CST) $85.00 NO BID
5 EMERGENCY SERVICE DURING OFFICE HOURS (7AM - 3:30 P.M. CST) $85.00 NO BID
6 EMERGENCY SERVICE AFTER/BEFORE OFFICE HOURS $150.00 NO BID
7 EMERGENCY SERVICES DURING WEEKEND (SATURDAY & SUNDAY) $150.00 NO BID
8 EMERGENCY SERVICES DURING HOLIDAY'S (ESTABLISHED/APPROVED BY COUNTY ONLY) $200.00 NO BID
9 GUARANTEED MAXIMUM DISCOUNT AVAILABLE IF CONTRACT IS RENEWED FOR 2ND YEAR ___ % 0.00% 0.00%

10 GUARANTEED MAXIMUM DISCOUNT AVAILABLE IF CONTRACT IS RENEWED FOR 3RD YEAR ___ % 0.00% 0.00%

1 REPAIRS ARE GUARANTEED NOT LATER THAN ___ DAYS AFTER ORDER DATE 2 NO BID

REQUIRED DOCUMENTS

SAFETY-KLEEN

NCH CORPORATION D/B/A CERTIFIED LABORATORIES

Experience Statement YES YES
Notification of Intent to Respond YES YES
Non-Collusion Affidavit YES YES
Affidavit of Contractor YES YES
EEOC Form YES YES
Debarment Statement YES YES
Price Sheet YES YES

Signature Page YES YES
ADDENDUM 1# YES YES
ADDENDUM 2# YES NO

CONTACT INFORMATION

SAFETY-KLEEN

2600 NORTH CENTRAL EXPRESSWAY SUITE 400 RICHARDSON, TX 75080|CHRISTOPHER FRANKS P:1-972-265-2008; F: 972-265-2947 E: WILLIAM.TITTERINGTON@SAFETY-KLEEN.COM

NCH CORPORATION D/B/A CERTIFIED LABORATORIES

2727 CHEMSEARCH BLVD IRVING, TX 75062] KATHLEEN LINDIG P: 1-972-438-0563: F: 972-438-0665 E: CERTIFIEDLABS.BIDDEPARTMENT@NCH.COM




